
M23 - LESS LETHAL & CHEMICAL AGENTS BID RECAP = AWARD

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

1 Less Lethal; Drag Stabilized, 
Bean-Bag, 12 Gauge Impact 
Round

Defense 
Technology      

#3027

Ea. No Bid No Bid 4.48$           2.82$              4.45$             

2 Less Lethal; 32Cal. Stinger 
Rubber Balls (18), 12 Gauge 
Impact Round

Defense 
Technology      

#3016

Ea. No Bid No Bid 4.20$           3.45$              4.19$             

3 Less Lethal; Stinger HV (High 
Velocity), 12 Gauge Impact 
Round

Defense 
Technology      

#3020

Ea. No Bid No Bid 4.20$           3.50$              4.19$             

4 Less Lethal; Fin Stabilized, 12 
Gauge Impact Round

Defense 
Technology      

#3021

Ea. No Bid No Bid 4.20$           3.45$              4.19$             

5 Projectile; Riot Control 
Dispersion, Muzzle Blast 
Instantaneous, CS, 37 mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1142

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.36$         15.30$            17.25$           

6 Projectile; Riot Control; 
Dispersion, Muzzle Blast, 
Instantaneous, OC, 37 mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1140

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.59$         15.30$            18.45$           

7 Projectile; Riot Control,          
"Skat-Shell", CS,  37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1172

Ea. No Bid No Bid 23.52$         19.55$            23.35$           

8 Projectile, Riot Control; Long 
Range "Spede-Heat" CS, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1182

Ea. No Bid No Bid 15.68$         13.65$            15.55$           

9 Projectile, Riot Control; Short 
Range "Spede-Heat" CS, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#2002

Ea. No Bid No Bid 16.52$         13.65$            16.40$           

10 Projectile, Ferret Barricade; OC 
Liquid, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1160

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.92$         No Bid 17.78$           

11 Projectile, Ferret Barricade; CS 
Liquid, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1162

Ea. No Bid No Bid 16.24$         No Bid 16.12$           

12 Projectile, Ferret Barricade; OC 
Powder, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1190

Ea. No Bid No Bid 19.60$         No Bid 19.45$           



Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

13 Projectile, Ferret Barricade; CS 
Powder, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1192

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.48$         No Bid 18.35$           

14 Barricade Round; Liquid Filled 
(Practice), 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1163

Ea. No Bid No Bid 15.12$         No Bid 15.00$           

15 Projectile; PepperBall, Hot PAVA 
Pepper Rounds, 90 count

PepperBall       
#PC3-R90

Jar No Bid No Bid 209.00$       No Bid No Bid

16 Projectile; PepperBall, Hot PAVA 
Pepper Rounds, 375 count

PepperBall       
#PC3-R375

Jar No Bid No Bid 812.25$       No Bid No Bid

17 #25 Tactical Distraction Device Defense 
Technology      
#7001NR

Ea. No Bid No Bid 25.98$         21.00$            37.80$           

18 Distraction Device;  Multi-Port 
Body

Defense 
Technology      

#7000

Ea. No Bid No Bid 44.97$         29.55$            44.65$           

19 Distraction Device; Reloads, 24 
per Case

Defense 
Technology      

#7001

Cs. No Bid No Bid 25.98$         17.00$            25.78$           

20 Distraction Device; 12 Gauge 
Aerial

Defense 
Technology      

#3019

Ea. No Bid No Bid 7.95$           4.35$              7.68$             

21 Grenade; Stinger, Plain Rubber 
Pellet Only, 10/Case

Defense 
Technology      

#1090

Cs. No Bid No Bid 336.00$       267.50$          333.50$         

22 Grenade; Stinger, with OC, 
10/Case

Defense 
Technology      

#1089

Cs. No Bid No Bid 358.50$       267.50$          355.90$         

23 Grenade; OC/CS Aerosol Defense 
Technology      

#1050

Ea. No Bid No Bid 45.42$         12.35$            45.10$           

24 Grenade; Flameless Expulsion, 
OC

Defense 
Technology      

#2040

Ea. No Bid No Bid 33.15$         27.95$            32.89$           



25 Grenade; Tactical Pocket, CN Defense 
Technology      

#1015

Ea. No Bid No Bid 21.00$         No Bid 20.89$           

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

26 Grenade; Tactical Pocket, CS Defense 
Technology      

#1016

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.76$         17.25$            18.65$           

27 Grenade; Smoke, Military 
Maximum

Defense 
Technology      

#1083

Ea. No Bid No Bid 27.55$         No Bid 27.39$           

28 Grenade; Smoke, Large 
Maximum

Defense 
Technology      

#1073

Ea. No Bid No Bid 30.02$         No Bid 29.80$           

29 Grenade; Triple Chaser, CS Defense 
Technology      

#1026

Ea. No Bid No Bid 35.84$         27.95$            35.59$           

30 Grenade; Riot Control, CN Defense 
Technology      

#1081

Ea. No Bid No Bid 28.00$         No Bid 27.82$           

31 Grenade; Riot Control, CS Defense 
Technology      

#1082

Ea. No Bid No Bid 25.76$         21.95$            25.63$           

32 Grenade, SAF, White Smoke Defense 
Technology      

#1063

Ea. No Bid No Bid 25.54$         23.25$            25.35$           

33 Grenade, Smoke; Military Style, 
Red Smoke

Defense 
Technology      

#1067

Ea. No Bid No Bid 37.02$         29.15$            36.78$           

34 Grenade, Smoke; Military Style, 
Blue Smoke

Defense 
Technology      

#1064

Ea. No Bid No Bid 37.02$         29.15$            36.78$           

35 Grenade, Smoke; Military Style, 
Green Smoke

Defense 
Technology      

#1065

Ea. No Bid No Bid 37.02$         26.75$            36.78$           

36 Grenade, Smoke; Military Style, 
Yellow Smoke

Defense 
Technology      

#1069

Ea. No Bid No Bid 37.02$         26.75$            36.78$           



37 Breaching Round, 12 Gauge Defense 
Technology      

#3105

Ea. No Bid No Bid 5.32$           4.25$              5.28$             

38 Projectile; 32 Cal. Stinger, 5.5" 
Casing, Black Powder, 37mm, 
175 Rubber Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#1196

Ea. No Bid No Bid 13.55$         11.70$            13.44$           

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

39 Projectile; 32 Cal. Stinger,  8" 
Casing, Black Powder, 37mm, 
225 Rubber Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#1197

Ea. No Bid No Bid 15.79$         14.15$            15.72$           

40 Projectile; 60 Cal. Stinger, 5.5" 
Casing, Black Powder, 37mm, 27 
Rubber Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#1198

Ea. No Bid No Bid 15.79$         14.15$            15.72$           

41 Projectile; 60 Cal. Stinger, 8" 
Casing, Black Powder, 37mm, 42 
Rubber Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#1199

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.47$         15.25$            17.36$           

42 Projectile; Wood Baton, Black 
Powder, 37mm, 5 Wood Batons 
per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#1176

Ea. No Bid No Bid 16.35$         15.25$            16.26$           

43 Projectile; Rubber Baton, Black 
Powder, 37mm, 5 Rubber Batons 
per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#1177

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.47$         15.25$            17.36$           

44 Projectile; Foam Baton, Black 
Powder, 37mm, 5 Foam Batons 
per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#1178

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.08$         No Bid 16.96$           

45 Projectile; Bean Bag; Black 
Powder, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1225

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.03$         16.25$            17.89$           

46 Projectile; "Flite Rite" Barricade 
Round, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1151

Ea. No Bid No Bid 39.20$         No Bid 38.89$           

47 Projectile; Bean Bag; Smokeless, 
37/40mm

Defense 
Technology      

#6225

Ea. No Bid No Bid 19.21$         16.25$            19.06$           

48 Projectile; 32 Cal. Stinger, 
Smokeless, 37/40mm, 130 
Rubber Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#6296

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.19$         15.15$            17.10$           



49 Projectile; 60 Cal. Stinger, 
Smokeless, 37/40mm, 18 Rubber 
Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#6297

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.64$         14.10$            17.50$           

50 Projectile; Wood Baton, 
Smokeless, 37/40mm, 3 Wood 
Batons per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#6298

Ea. No Bid No Bid 15.46$         15.15$            15.36$           

51 Projectile; Foam Baton,  
Smokeless, 37/40mm, 3 Foam 
Batons per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#6299

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.37$         No Bid 18.26$           

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

52 Projectile; 32 Cal. Stinger, 
Smokeless, 40mm, 130 Rubber 
Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#6096

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.09$         No Bid 16.94$           

53 Projectile; 60 Cal. Stinger, 
Smokeless, 40mm, 18 Rubber 
Pellets

Defense 
Technology      

#6097

Ea. No Bid No Bid 19.05$         No Bid 18.89$           

54 Projectile; Wood Baton, 
Smokeless, 40mm, 3 Wood 
Batons per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#6098

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.36$         No Bid 17.22$           

55 Projectile; Foam Baton,  
Smokeless, 40mm, 3 Foam 
Batons per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#6099

Ea. No Bid No Bid 18.50$         No Bid 18.33$           

56 Projectile; Rubber Baton, 
Smokeless, 40mm, 3 Rubber 
Batons per Projectile

Defense 
Technology      

#6064

Ea. No Bid No Bid 23.18$         No Bid 23.00$           

57 Projectile; Bean Bag; Smokeless, 
40mm

Defense 
Technology      

#6025

Ea. No Bid No Bid 24.55$         No Bid 24.33$           

58 Projectile; "eXact iMpact", 
Sponge, 40mm

Defense 
Technology      

#6325

Ea. No Bid No Bid 17.36$         No Bid 17.22$           

59 Launcher, Less Lethal; Single 
Projectile, Smooth Bore, Full 
Stock, 37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1315           

Ea. No Bid No Bid 583.50$       No Bid 580.00$         

60 Launcher, Less Lethal; Smooth 
Bore, 6-Shot, Composite Stock, 
37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1319           

Ea. No Bid No Bid 2,250.00$     No Bid 2,240.00$      



61 Launcher, Less Lethal; Smooth 
Bore, 6-Shot, Folding Stock, 
37mm

Defense 
Technology      

#1322           

Ea. No Bid No Bid 2,254.00$     No Bid 2,240.00$      

62 Launcher, Less Lethal; Single 
Projectile, Rifled Bore, Full 
Stock, 40mm 

Defense 
Technology      

#1325           

Ea. No Bid No Bid 774.80$       No Bid 769.00$         

63 Launcher, Less Lethal; Multi-
Shot, Full Stock, 40mm 

Defense 
Technology      

#1377           

Ea. No Bid No Bid 2,840.00$     No Bid 2,850.00$      

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

64 Launcher; PepperBall Semi-
Automatic Carbine w/ 180-round 
hopper, 13 cu. In. HPA Bottle, 

PepperBall       
#PS-SA200

Ea. No Bid No Bid 589.95$       No Bid No Bid

65 Launcher; PepperBall Automatic 
Carbine w/ 200-round hopper, 13 
cu. In. HPA Bottle & case

PepperBall       
#TAC-700

Ea. No Bid No Bid 969.95$       No Bid No Bid

66 High Pressure Air Bottle (HPA); 
48 Cubic Inch Capacity for 
PepperBall Launchers

PepperBall       
#PA-HPA-48

Ea. No Bid No Bid 134.00$       No Bid No Bid

67 SCUBA Air Fill Adapter for 
Pepperball High-Pressure Air 
Bottles

Pepperball        
#PA-FA

Ea. No Bid No Bid 71.25$         No Bid No Bid

68 Mask, Gas; CBRN, Opti-Fit, 
Available in Small, Medium & 
Large Sizes

Defense 
Technology      
#1740 sm.        

#1741 med.       
#1742 lg.         
or Equal

Ea. No Bid No Bid 235.20$       260.00$          235.00$         

69 Canister, Replacement; CBRN for 
Opti-Fit Gas Mask

Defense 
Technology      

#1745           
or Equal

Ea. No Bid No Bid 39.79$         52.00$            39.45$           

70 Taser; Taser International Model 
X-26, w/XDPM, Yellow 

Taser            
26024           

No Substitute

Ea. No Bid 814.95$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

71 Taser XP Air Cartridge, Single 
Shot, 25' Range

Taser            
44203

Ea. No Bid 23.90$          No Bid No Bid No Bid



72 Taser Standard Air Cartridge, 
Single Shot, 21' Range

Taser            
44200

Ea. No Bid 20.90$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 Taser Standard Training Air 
Cartridge, Single Shot, 15' Range

Taser            
34200

Ea. No Bid 18.90$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

74 Taser XDPM (Extended Digital 
Power Magazine

Taser            
26701

Ea. No Bid 37.95$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item Description Brand/Model # U/M
LC Action 

Police Supply
ProForce Law 
Enforcement

Adamson 
Police 

Products Quartermaster
Aardvark 
Tactical

75 Taser X-26 USB Dataport 
Interface

Taser            
26500

Ea. No Bid 159.95$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

76 Holster, Taser; Ballistic Nylon for 
X-26 Taser

Taser Int'l or SO 
Tech

Ea. No Bid 49.99$          No Bid No Bid No Bid

77 Pepper Spray, "First Defense" OC 
Aerosol, 10%, 1.47 oz. MK-3

Defense 
Technology      

#5039

Ea. No Bid No Bid 9.05$           7.90$              9.04$             

78 Pepper Spray, "First Defense" OC 
Aerosol, 10%, 3 oz. MK-4

Defense 
Technology      

#5049

Ea. No Bid No Bid 10.15$         8.35$              10.17$           

79 Pepper Spray, "First Defense" OC 
Aerosol, 10%, .68 oz. MK-6

Defense 
Technology      

#5069

Ea. No Bid No Bid 8.70$           7.95$              8.71$             

80 Pepper Spray, "First Defense" OC 
Aerosol, 10%, 12 oz. MK-9

Defense 
Technology      

#5099

Ea. No Bid No Bid 32.03$         24.95$            32.13$           

81 MK-4, Aerosol, Inert; Stream, 3 
oz., for training purposes

Defense 
Technology      

#5149

Ea. No Bid No Bid 8.99$           8.20$              8.99$             

82 MK-6, Aerosol, Inert; Stream, .68 
oz., for training purposes

Defense 
Technology      

#5169

Ea. No Bid No Bid 7.69$           7.05$              7.64$             

Discount off Catalog Price 0% 0% 0% 0%

Brand(s) Bidding NO BID As Specified As Specified ALS As Specified



Comments

Price Increases 
= 2nd Yr 3%; 

3rd Yr. 3%

NOTES: Although ALS is less expensive, they do not offer a full line (ex. No "Ferret" rounds or munitions launchers), NO References submitted. 

Aardvark Tactical will be awarded Primary Vendor, however, Adamson Police Products will also be awarded as a secondary supplier. 


