M22 - DUTY GEAR BID RECAP

Lawmen's Law
Aardvark LC Action Adamson GT ProForce Law Shooters Enforcement
Item Description Brand/Model # Tactical Galls Police Supply Police Distributors | Enforcement | Bob Barker | Roper Supply Supply KKF Inc. Targets
1  |Holster, Duty; Black, Basketweave, Right Safariland $ 88.50 87.19 No Bid $ 82.03 No Bid $ 80.48 | $ 83.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand, Laminate, Level Il, Self-Locking #6285
System, to fit Glock 17
2  |Holster, Duty; Black, Basketweave, Right Safariland $ 88.50 87.19 No Bid $ 82.03 No Bid $ 80.48 | $ 83.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand, Laminate, Level Il, Self-Locking #6285
System, to fit Glock 21
3 |Holster, Duty; Black, Basketweave, Left Safariland $ 88.50 87.19 No Bid $ 82.03 No Bid $ 80.48 | $ 83.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand, Laminate, Level Il, Self-Locking #6285
System, to fit Glock 17
4  |Holster, Duty; Black, Basketweave, Left Safariland $ 88.50 87.19 No Bid $ 82.03 No Bid $ 80.48 | $ 83.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand, Laminate, Level Il, Self-Locking #6285
System, to fit Glock 21
5  |Holster, Off Duty Concealment; Black, Aker No Bid 36.96 | $ 37.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 51.63 No Bid $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Plain, Right Hand, FlatSider w/Tension #XR-13
Screw, Dual Slot, to fit Glock 17
6 |Holster, Off Duty Concealment; Black, Aker No Bid 36.96 | $ 37.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 51.63 No Bid $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Plain, Right Hand, FlatSider w/Tension #XR-13
Screw, Dual Slot, to fit Glock 21
7  |Holster, Off Duty Concealment; Black, Aker No Bid 36.96 | $ 37.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 51.63 No Bid $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Plain, Left Hand, FlatSsider w/Tension #XR-13
Screw, Dual Slot, to fit Glock 17
8  |Holster, Off Duty Concealment; Black, Aker No Bid 36.96 | $ 37.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 51.63 No Bid $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Plain, Left Hand, FlatSider w/Tension #XR-13
Screw, Dual Slot, to fit Glock 21
9  |Holster, Off-Duty Concealment; Black; Blackhawk $ 35.25 3512 [ $ 3198 | $ 4795 | $ 32,76 | $ 4164 | $ 4413 | $ 36.27 | $ 39.20 No Bid No Bid
Right Hand 410000 BK-R
10 |Holster, Off-Duty Concealment, Black; Left|  Blackhawk $ 35.25 3512 [ $ 3198 | $ 4795 | $ 32,76 | $ 4164 | $ 4413 | $ 36.27 | $ 39.20 No Bid No Bid
Hand 410000 BK-L
11 |Holster, Off-Duty Concealment; Black, Left|  Blackhawk $ 35.25 3512 | $ 3198 | $ 4795 | $ 32,76 | $ 4164 | $ 4413 | $ 36.27 | $ 39.20 No Bid No Bid
Hand, Fits Glock 21 410013-L
12 |Holster, Off-Duty Concealment; Black, Blackhawk $ 35.25 3512 | $ 3198 | $ 4795 | $ 32,76 | $ 4164 | $ 4413 | $ 36.27 | $ 39.20 No Bid No Bid
Right Hand, Fits Glock 22 410013-R
Lawmen's Law
Aardvark LC Action Adamson GT ProForce Law Shooters Enforcement
Item Description Brand/Model # Tactical Galls Police Supply Police Distributors | Enforcement | Bob Barker | Roper Supply Supply KKF Inc. Targets




13 |Magazine Pouch; Double, Black, Safariland $ 2425 | $ 24.24 No Bid $ 22.69 No Bid $ 2238 | $ 24.69 No Bid $ 1925 | $ 19.80 No Bid
Basketweave, Chrome Snap, Laminate, to #17
fit Glock 17 Mags
14 |Magazine Pouch; Double, Black, Safariland $ 2425 | $ 24.24 No Bid $ 22.69 No Bid $ 22.38 | $ 24.69 No Bid $ 1925 | $ 19.80 No Bid
Basketweave, Chrome Snap, Laminate, to #17
fit Glock 21 Mags
15 |Magazine Pouch; Concealment, Double, Safariland $ 21.00 | $ 20.89 No Bid $ 19.66 No Bid $ 19.29 | $ 23.18 No Bid $ 1540 | $ 17.62 No Bid
Black, Plain, Laminate, to fit Glock 17 #079
16 |Magazine Pouch; Concealment, Double, Safariland $ 21.00 | $ 20.89 No Bid $ 19.66 No Bid $ 19.29 | $ 23.18 No Bid $ 1540 | $ 17.62 No Bid
Black, Plain, Laminate, to fit Glock 21 #079
17 |Magazine Pouch; Concealment, Black, Blackhawk $ 13.00 | $ 13.08 | $ 1191 | $ 1795 | $ 1221 $ 1552 [ $ 1645 | $ 1343 | $ 15.76 No Bid No Bid
Double row CF Finish Blackhawk CQC 410600CBK
18 |Case, Handcuff; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 2225 | $ 22.10 No Bid $ 20.79 No Bid $ 2040 | $ 20.25 No Bid $ 1596 | $ 16.49 No Bid
Chrome Snap, Laminate #190-4
19 |Holder, Pepper Spray; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 1875 $ 18.75 No Bid $ 17.95 No Bid $ 1731 | $ 19.88 No Bid $ 15.18 No Bid No Bid
Chrome Snap, Laminate, to fit Cap-Stun #38-5-4
20 [Holder, Pepper Spray; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 1875 $ 18.75 No Bid $ 17.95 No Bid $ 1731 | $ 19.88 No Bid $ 1518 | $ 15.68 No Bid
Chrome Snap, Laminate, to fit Defense #38-4-5
Technology MK-3
21 [|Holder, Key Ring; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 575 | $ 5.89 No Bid $ 5.99 No Bid $ 544 | $ 6.51 No Bid $ 413 | $ 5.22 No Bid
Chrome Snap, Laminate #169S
22 |Holder, Radio; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 2425 | $ 24.24 No Bid $ 22.85 No Bid $ 2238 | $ 20.56 No Bid $ 16.01 | $ 16.49 No Bid
Laminate #761
23 |Holder, Baton; Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 1875 | $ 18.75 No Bid $ 17.64 No Bid $ 1731 [ $ 8.08 No Bid $ 1359 | $ 15.94 No Bid
Laminate, with bottom release, to fit #35
ASP F-26B
24  |Holder, Baton; Black, Basketweave, Aker No Bid $ 1845 [ $ 16.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 19.88 No Bid $ 13.04 No Bid No Bid
Laminate, with open bottom, to fit #552
ASP F-26B
25 |Holder, Baton ASP F-26 Scabbard ASP $ 31.00 | $ 2572 | $ 26.67 | $ 32.00 No Bid No Bid $ 32.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sidebreak Rotating, Basketweave 52633
Lawmen's Law
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Item Description Brand/Model # Tactical Galls Police Supply Police Distributors | Enforcement | Bob Barker | Roper Supply Supply KKEF Inc. Targets
26 |Holder, TASER, Duty, Black, to fit TASER Blackhawk $ 30.00 2975 | $ 27.09 | $ 39.95 27.76 | $ 35.29 3740 | $ 30.52 33.75 No Bid No Bid
X-26 44H015BK-R &
44H015BK-L




27 |Keepers, Belt; 1" Wide, Black, Bianchi $ 775 |3 7.77 No Bid $ 7.95 No Bid $ 2077 | $ 8.96 No Bid $ 946 | $ 6.40 No Bid
Basketweave, Double Chrome Snaps, Four #33 or
(4) per pack Safariland
#65
28  [Belt, Duty; Men's, Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 4450 | $ 44.20 No Bid $ 41.59 No Bid $ 40.80 | $ 43.91 No Bid $ 3020 | $ 35.21 No Bid
2.25 inch, Suede Lined, Chrome Buckle, #87
Laminate
29 |(Belt, Duty; Women's, Black, Basketweave, Safariland $ 46.50 | $ 46.35 No Bid $ 43.60 No Bid $ 42.77 | $ 43.91 No Bid $ 3311 | $ 37.95 No Bid
2.25 inch, Suede Lined, Chrome Buckle, #872
Laminate
30 |(Belt, Duty; Black, Basketweave, 2.25 inch, Bianchi $ 50.50 | $ 50.10 No Bid $ 47.13 No Bid $ 46.24 | $ 43.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Padded Ergonomic Type, Chrome Buckle, AccuMold
Laminate #7965
31 |(Belt, Duty; Black Nylon, 2.25 inch Bianchi $ 28.00 | $ 27.86 No Bid $ 26.21 No Bid $ 2571 | $ 43.91 No Bid $ 2090 | $ 22.55 No Bid
AccuMold
#7200
32 |Keepers, Belt; 1" Wide, Black Nylon, Bianchi $ 850 | $ 8.57 No Bid $ 8.10 No Bid $ 791 | $ 8.96 No Bid $ 6.99 | $ 5.50 No Bid
Double Snaps, Four (4) per pack AccuMold
#6406
33 |Holster, Duty; Black Nylon, Right or Left Bianchi No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 49.50 No Bid $ 48.46 | $ 61.74 No Bid 3 34.27 No Bid No Bid
Hand, to fit Glock 17 AccuMold Discontinued | Discontinued
#7125
Item Item
34  [Holster, Duty; Black Nylon, Right or Left Bianchi $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid $ 49.39 No Bid $ 48.46 | $ 61.74 No Bid $ 34.27 No Bid No Bid
Hand, to fit Glock 21 AccuMold Discontinued
#7125 ltem
35 [Magazine Pouch; Double, Black Nylon, Bianchi $ 20.00 | $ 19.82 No Bid $ 18.65 No Bid $ 18.30 | $ 18.87 No Bid $ 1634 | $ 15.47 No Bid
Hidden Snap Closure, to fit Glock 17 AccuMold
#7302
36 |Magazine Pouch; Double, Black Nylon, Bianchi $ 20.00 | $ 19.82 No Bid $ 18.65 No Bid $ 18.30 | $ 18.87 No Bid $ 1634 | $ 15.47 No Bid
Hidden Snap Closure, to fit Glock 21 AccuMold
#7302
Lawmen's Law
Aardvark LC Action Adamson GT ProForce Law Shooters Enforcement
Item Description Brand/Model # Tactical Galls Police Supply Police Distributors | Enforcement | Bob Barker | Roper Supply Supply KKEF Inc. Targets
37 |Case, Handcuff; Black Nylon, Hidden Snap Bianchi $ 1450 | $ 14.46 No Bid $ 13.65 No Bid $ 1335 | $ 10.96 No Bid $ 1067 | $ 12.35 No Bid
Closure AccuMold
#7300
38 |Holder, Pepper Spray; Black Nylon, Hidden Bianchi $ 1400 | $ 13.93 No Bid $ 13.15 No Bid $ 12.86 | $ 13.71 No Bid 3 1166 | $ 10.66 No Bid
Snap Closure AccuMold

#7307




39 [Holder, Baton; Black Nylon, for 26 inch Bianchi $ 1325 | $ 13.39 No Bid $ 12.60 No Bid $ 1236 | $ 13.01 No Bid $ 11.00 | $ 10.66 No Bid
Expandable Baton AccuMold
#7313
40 |Holder, Radio; Black Nylon Bianchi $ 18.00 | $ 17.95 No Bid $ 16.89 No Bid $ 1657 | $ 17.13 No Bid $ 1568 | $ 14.05 No Bid
AccuMold
#7314
41 |Baton, Expandable; Steel, Black, 26 inch ASP $ 7205 | $ 5413 | $ 61.33 | $ 73.60 No Bid No Bid $ 74.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#F-26-B
42 |Baton, Foam Training, 26 inch. ASP $ 50.00 | $ 39.32 [ $ 4333 | $ 52.00 No Bid No Bid $ 52.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
07200
43 |Red Gun Taser X26 Training Gun Galls No Bid $ 29.10 | $ 3133 | $ 37.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 33.23 No Bid No Bid
TN127
44 |Handcuffs; Standard, Carbon Steel/Nickel Peerless $ 21.00 | $ 2115 | $ 19.65 | $ 21.88 | $ 20.10 No Bid $ 2083 | $ 2245 | $ 22.52 No Bid No Bid
Finish #REPL700
45  |Handcuffs; Oversize, Carbon Steel/Nickel Peerless $ 36.75 | $ 3526 | $ 3333 [ $ 39.67 | $ 34.80 | $ 1728 | $ 3710 | $ 38.30 | $ 37.75 No Bid No Bid
Finish #REPL7030
46 |Handcuffs, Standard, Satin Nickel Finish | Smith & Wesson No Bid $ 1992 | $ 2161 | $ 2250 | $ 1967 | $ 1580 | $ 20.86 | $ 2245 | $ 19.60 No Bid No Bid
#100
47 |Leg Irons; Standard, Carbon Steel/Nickel Peerless $ 36.00 | $ 33.04 [ $ 3252 | $ 3947 | $ 34.51 No Bid $ 36.10 | $ 37.00 | $ 37.75 No Bid No Bid
Finish #REPL703
48 |Restraints, Hobble; polypropylene webbed RIPP $ 1150 | $ 1012 | $ 2222 | $ 12.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 14.45 No Bid No Bid
belt, Bronze snap at one end, other end #RS-078
permanently inserted through a self-locking
jawed alligator clip, 52" L X 1" W
49  |Restraints, Flex-Cuff; Heavy Duty Plastic, Galls No Bid $ 74.29 No Bid $ 85.76 No Bid $ 61.69 | $ 145.23 No Bid $ 74.72 No Bid No Bid
22" long, 100 Pack, NIK RS-048
50 [Restraints, Flex-Cuff; Heavy Duty Plastic, Galls No Bid $ 663.55 No Bid $ 642.75 No Bid $ 462.34 | $  1,452.30 No Bid $ 747.20 No Bid No Bid
22" long, 1000 Pack RS-067
Lawmen's Law
Aardvark LC Action Adamson GT ProForce Law Shooters Enforcement
Item Description Brand/Model # Tactical Galls Police Supply Police Distributors | Enforcement | Bob Barker | Roper Supply Supply KKEF Inc. Targets
51 |Restraints, Transport; Stainless Steel, Smith & Wesson No Bid $ 73.46 | $ 8163 | $ 88.15 | $ 72.59 No Bid $ 7696 | $ 80.00 | $ 73.27 No Bid No Bid
handcuffs & leg irons connected with a 32" #1850
chain
52 |Belly Chain, includes handcuffs, 54" L Smith & Wesson No Bid $ 58.00 | $ 64.44 | $ 7733 | $ 72.59 No Bid $ 54.25 | $ 57.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1800
53 [Lightsticks, 6", 12 Hour Duration, 100 Pack| ~ Omniglow No Bid $ 7857 | $ 10.29 No Bid $ 7428 | $ 81.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HS-131
54  |Flashlight, Rechargable, with AC/DC Mag-Lite No Bid $ 83.60 | $ 8348 | $ 90.03 [ $ 7581 | $ 92.76 | $ 91.66 | $ 84.99 | $ 80.52 No Bid No Bid
Charger RX1019
55 |Gun Light, Tactical; LED Streamlight | $ 9750 | $ 9098 | $ 87.30 | $ 96.87 | $ 89.79 | $ 8953 | $ 108.87 | $ 9791 | $ 97.74 No Bid No Bid

TLR-1




56 |Gun Light, Tactical; LED w/ Laser Sight Streamlight | 24350 | $ 22651 | $ 21735 | $ 23122 | $ 224.06 | $ 22291 | $ 27105 | $ 23426 | $ 235.89 No Bid No Bid
TLR-2
57 |Protector, Hearing Peltor No Bid $ 526 | $ 65.28 No Bid $ 49.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 74.77 No Bid $ 60.75
Tactical 6-S
58 |Glasses, Shooting Safety; with side Radians No Bid $ 439 | $ 2.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 45,52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
protection, Clears Lenses, Meets or Exceeds Galaxy
ANSI 287.1 GX0110ID
59 |Rifle Case DoskoSport No Bid No Bid $ 34.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 216.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10470
Discount off Catalog Price 0% 10-15% 5-25% 0% 8% 0.00% 3% 0% 35-40% 40% 5%
Items 33 & 34 Bidding Gould Bidding Don Bidding Gould
are Bianchi & Goodrich Hume Leather & Goodrich
7120 as Leather Leather
recommended

NOTE: Prices in RED indicate vendor is bidding a like or equal product other than that listed on RFP.

Quartermaster did not submit references as required by Minimum Vendor Requirements on page 2.

replacement for

7125




