K99 - INMATE CLOTHING BID RECAP Award
NOTE: Below is the tabulation of bids received. Awards will not be made and announced until samples have been evaluated.
Award notification will be posted on this website at a later date.

Per the RFP, Local Vendors will be given a 5% preference. The two local Vendors are Michelle Laurent & American Tex Chem.

1. SHIRT Robinson's Textiles Bob Barker Co. Uniforms Mfg. ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group
1 2 1 2 1 2 1 2
X-Small $ 4000|$ 4200|$ 5250[($% 59.00($ 5100|$ 5100|$% 84.00($ 84.00
Small $ 4000|$ 4200|$ 5250[($% 59.00($ 5100|$ 5100|$% 84.00($ 84.00
Medium $ 4300|$ 5000|$% 5250[($% 59.00($ 5300|$% 53.00[$% 84.00($ 84.00
Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5250[($% 59.00($ 5300|$% 53.00[$% 84.00($ 84.00
X-Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5250[($% 59.00($ 5700|$ 5700|$% 84.00($ 84.00
2X-Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5250[($% 59.00($ 5800|% 5800[$% 84.00($ 84.00
3X-Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5250($% 59.00($ 6100|$ 6200|$% 84.00($ 84.00
4X-Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5250[($% 59.00($ 6400|$% 65.00|$% 108.00($ 108.00
5X-Large $ 4600|$ 5800|$% 5800[($% 6500($% 6400|$% 6500|$% 108.00($ 108.00
7X-Large $ 5100|$ 6500|$% 5800[($% 6500($% 6400|% 6500|$% 108.00($ 108.00
9X-Large $ 5100|$ 6500|$% 5800[($% 6500($% 6400|$% 6500|$% 108.00($ 108.00
LOW BID




2. PANTS Robinson's Textiles Bob Barker Co. Uniforms Mfg. ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group|Color Group
1 2 1 2 1 2 1 2

X-Small $ 5100|$ 5600|$%$ 6200($% 7100($ 6100|$% 6100|$% 84.00($ 84.00
Small $ 5100[$ 5600|$%$ 6200($% 7100($ 6100|$% 6100|$% 84.00($ 84.00
Medium $ 5300|$ 6800|$%$ 6200($% 7100($ 6300|$% 6500[$% 84.00($% 84.00
Large $ 5700[($ 7000|$ 6200($% 7100($ 6500|$% 6500|$% 84.00($ 84.00
X-Large $ 5700|($ 7000|$ 6200($% 7100($ 6500|$% 6500|% 84.00($ 84.00
2X-Large $ 5700[$ 7000|$ 6200($% 7100($ 6700|$% 6700|$% 84.00($% 84.00
3X-Large $ 5700|($ 7000|$ 6200[($% 7100($ 6700|$% 6700|$% 84.00($ 84.00
4X-Large $ 5700[($ 7000|$ 6850[($% 80.00($ 7200|$ 72.00|$ 108.00($ 108.00
5X-Large $ 5700[$ 7000|$ 6850[($% 80.00($ 8400|$% 84.00|$% 108.00($ 108.00
6X-Large $ 5700[$ 7000|$ 6850[$% 80.00($ 8400|$% 84.00|$% 108.00($ 108.00
7X-Large $ 6300|$ 7600|$ 73.00($% 8450|$ 8400|$% 84.00|$% 108.00($ 108.00
9X-Large $ 6300|$ 7600|$ 73.00($% 8450|$ 8400|$% 8500|$% 108.00($ 108.00

LOW BID




Chatham

Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms |Team Safety Knitting | Thomaston
3. COVERALLS Textiles Co. Mfg. Apparel ICS Mills Corp
Price Each Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 890 [$ 1165|% 968|% 19.00($ 1200 | $ 9.00 | $ 12.99
Medium $ 890 ($ 1115|% 968|% 19.00($ 1200 | $ 9.00 | $ 12.99
Large $ 990 ($ 10699 968|% 19.00($ 1200 | $ 9.00 | $ 12.99
X-Large $ 990 ($ 1022|% 968|$% 19.00($ 1200 | $ 9.00 | $ 12.99
2X-Large $ 990 ($ 1022|% 968 |$ 21.00($% 1200 |($ 940 |$ 15.60
3X-Large $ 990 |$ 1022|$ 1065(% 2100|$ 1200]|% 9.70 | $ 15.60
4X-Large $ 990 |$ 1022|$ 1065($% 2500|%$ 1200|% 1000($ 1798
5X-Large $ 990 |$ 1022|$ 1065($% 2500|%$ 1200|% 1050($ 1798
Min Order none 12 Each 12 Each none 500 none 5 dozen
Robinson's | Bob Barker | Uniforms Thomaston
4. FEMALE SHIRTS Textiles Co. Mfg. ICS Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 5200|$ 4944|% 43.00|$ 14400 ($ 83.98
Medium $ 5200|$ 4944|% 43.00|$ 14400 ($ 83.98
Large $ 5800|$ 4944|% 43.00|9$ 14400 ($ 83.98
X-Large $ 5800|$ 4944|% 43.00|$ 14400 ($ 83.98
2X-Large $ 5800|$ 4944|% 49.00|$ 14400 ($ 89.98
3X-Large $ 5800|$ 5196|$% 49.00|$ 14400 ($ 89.98
4X-Large $ 5800|$% 5448 |% 52.00|% 14400 ($ 89.98
5X-Large $ 5800[$% 5700|% 52.00|% 14400 ($ 89.98
Min. Order none 12 Each 12 Each 500 5 dozen




Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms Thomaston
5. FEMALE PANTS Textiles Co. Mfg. ICS Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 5100|$ 6216|$% 54.00|$ 14400 ($ 87.20
Medium $ 5100|$ 6216|$ 54.00|$ 14400 ($ 87.20
Large $ 5700|$ 6216|$ 54.00|$ 14400 ($ 87.20
X-Large $ 5700|$ 6216|$ 54.00|$ 14400 ($ 87.20
2X-Large $ 5700|$ 6216|$ 54.00|$ 14400 ($ 90.30
3X-Large $ 5700|$ 6216|$% 60.00|$ 14400 ($ 90.30
4X-Large $ 5700|$% 6840|% 60.00|$ 14400 ($ 94.40
5X-Large $ 5700|$ 6840|% 62.00|% 14400 ($ 94.40
Min. Order none 12 Each 12 Each 500 5 dozen

Uniforms Michelle | The Liberty
6. DUTY SHIRTS Mfg. Laurent Store
Price Each Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 1353|$ 13.70|$ 77.76
Medium $ 1353|$ 13.70|$ 77.76
Large $ 1353 ($ 13.70|$ 77.76
X-Large $ 1353|$ 13.70|$ 77.76
2X-Large $ 1500(|$ 1470|$ 89.76
3X-Large $ 1500(|$ 1570|$% 89.76
4X-Large $ 1600|$ 16.70|$ 96.76
Min. Order 12 Each 10 dozen

LOCAL




Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms |Team Safety
7. SCRUB TOPS Textiles Co. Mfg. Apparel
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 4000|$ 46.00|$% 4168|9% 67.80
Medium $ 4000|$ 46.00|% 4168|9% 67.80
Large $ 4500($ 46.00|$% 4168|9% 67.80
X-Large $ 4500($ 4800|% 4168|9% 67.80
2X-Large $ 4500($ 4900|% 4168|% 78.00
3X-Large $ 4500($ 4900|$% 4168|% 78.00
4X-Large $ 4500($% 5800|% 46.00|$ 84.00
5X-Large $ 45.00 | No Bid $ 4700|$ 84.00
Min. Order none none 12 Each none
Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms |Team Safety

8. SCRUB PANTS Textiles Co. Mfg. Apparel
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 5000[$ 4964|% 51.00|% 67.80
Medium $ 5000[$ 4964|% 51.00|% 67.80
Large $ 5400($ 4964|% 51.00|% 67.80
X-Large $ 5400($ 4964|% 51.00|% 67.80
2X-Large $ 5400($ 4964|% 51.00|$% 78.00
3X-Large $ 5400[$ 5520|% 56.00|% 78.00
4X-Large $ 5400[$ 5520|% 56.00|% 84.00
Min. Order none none 12 Each none




Chatham

Robinson's | Bob Barker| Walter Uniforms Knitting | Thomaston
9. GYM SHORTS Textiles Co. Stephens Mfg. ICS Mills Corp
Price Each Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 2751 % 405 $ 3931|% 377 1$ 340 | $ 310 | $ 4.05
Medium $ 2751 % 405 $ 393|% 377 1$ 340 | $ 310 | $ 4.05
Large $ 349 | $ 405 $ 393|% 377 1$ 340 | $ 310 | $ 4.05
X-Large $ 349 | $ 405 $ 393|% 377 1$ 340 | $ 310 | $ 4.05
2X-Large $ 349 | $ 455 % 393|% 377 1% 400 | $ 320 | $ 4.50
3X-Large $ 349 | $ 505|% 393|% 377 1% 400 | $ 320 | $ 4.50
4X-Large $ 349 | $ 5551% 393|% 377 1$ 400 | $ 320 | $ 5.25
5X-Large $ 349 | $ 6.05| % 42319% 377 1$ 400 | $ 340 | $ 5.25
Min. Order none none S0pr. 12pr. 500 none none
Bob Barker ATD Uniforms Carolina DeSoto Acme | Thomaston
10. SOCK Co. American | CAL PIA Mfg. Textiles Mills ICS Supply Corp
Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 0385|$ 05225|$% 095|% 0381]% 0381 % 063|$% 0.4258 | $ 0451] % 0.48




Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina | Fruit of the Acme | Thomaston
11. T-SHIRT Textiles Co. American | CAL PIA Mfg. Textiles Loom ICS Supply Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Large $ 1500(|$ 1149|$ 1564 (% 3564 (|$ 1072|$ 13.09|% 1672($ 1140|$ 1500|$ 14.10
X-Large $ 1500(|$ 1149|$ 1564 (% 3564 (|$ 1072|$ 13.09|% 1672($ 13.00|$ 15.00|% 14.10
2X-Large $ 1750(|$ 1369|$ 2094 (% 4212|$ 1400|$ 16.06|$ 2496($ 16.00|$ 15.00|$ 18.10
3X-Large $ 1900(|$ 2225|$% 2194 (% 4212|$ 1450|%$ 1716|$ 2496($ 1800|%$ 15.00|$ 18.10
4X-Large $ 2400|$ 2325|$% 2624 (% 4212|$ 2600|$ 2156|$% 2496($ 2600|$ 16.00|$ 23.10
5X-Large $ 2600|$ 2525|$% 2724($% 5076|$% 2800|% 2266|% 2496($% 3200|%$ 17.00|$ 23.10
7X-Large $ 3990|$ 3100|$% 2984($% 5076|$% 3700|% 32.56 | NoBid $ 3400|$ 18.00|% 30.10
9X-Large $ 4590|$ 3400|$ 3454($% 6216|$ 48.00|% 32.56 | NoBid $ 6200|$ 19.00|$% 30.10

Lafayette | Lafayette | Lafayette

Bob Barker| Uniforms Apek The Liberty| Textile Textile Textile
12. T-SHIRT Co. Mfg. Apparel ICS Store (White) (Colors) (Ash)
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 3150|$ 3900|$% 31.32($% 4800($ 2880|% 3075|$% 3750($% 33.30
Medium $ 3150|$ 3900|$% 31.32($% 4800($ 2880|% 3075|% 3750($% 33.30
Large $ 3240|$ 3900|$% 31.32($% 4800($ 2880|% 3075|% 3750($% 33.30
X-Large $ 3300[$ 3900|$% 31.32($% 4800($ 2880|% 3075|% 3750($% 33.30
2X-Large $ 3840|$ 5700|$% 4308(% 7440($ 4080|% 40.00|$ 4900 (% 4375
3X-Large $ 5015|$% 5700|$% 4308(% 7440($ 4080|% 40.00|$ 4900 ($ 4375
4X-Large $ 5035|$% 5900|$% 4308(% 8640($ 4990|% 40.00|$ 4900 ($ 4375
5X-Large $ 5199|$ 5900|$% 4308(% 8640($ 5380|% 40.00|$ 4900 ($ 4375
Min. Order dozen dozen 500 500 100 dozen [none none none




Lafayette | Lafayette | Lafayette

Bob Barker| Uniforms Apek The Liberty| Textile Textile Textile
13. T-SHIRTS Co. Mfg. Apparel ICS Store (White) (Colors) (Ash)
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 5900|$ 6100|$ 46.08[$ 6400|$ 4360|$% 4025|% 4765($% 4260
Medium $ 5900|$ 6100|$ 46.08[$ 6400|$ 4360|$% 4025|% 4765($% 4260
Large $ 5900|$ 6100|$ 46.08[$ 8400|$ 4360|$% 4025|$% 4765($% 4260
X-Large $ 5900|$ 6100|$ 46.08[$% 8400($ 4360|$% 4025|$% 4765($% 4260
2X-Large $ 6200|$ 8200|$ 59.76 % 12000($ 5460|$% 5000|$% 6350($% 56.25
3X-Large $ 6200|$ 11200|$ 59.76 [$ 12000|$ 5460|$% 5000|$% 6350($% 56.25
4X-Large No Bid $ 112.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5790|$ 5000|$% 6350|$% 56.25
5X-Large No Bid $ 120.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5890|$ 5000|$% 6350|$% 56.25
Min. Order dozen dozen 500 500 100 dozen [none none none

Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina | Fruit of the Acme | Thomaston
14. UNDERSHORTS Textiles Co. American Mfg. Textiles Loom ICS Supply Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 950 | $ 959 | $ 884 1% 7951 % 825[($% 1059|% 990($ 1000]|% 7.99
Medium $ 950 | $ 959 | $ 884 1% 7951 % 825[($% 1059|% 990 ($ 1000 % 7.99
Large $ 950 | $ 959 | $ 88419 795|% 825($% 1059|% 990($ 1000]|% 7.99
X-Large $ 950 | $ 959 | $ 884 1% 7951 % 825($% 1059|% 990($ 1000 % 7.99
2X-Large $ 1050|$ 1089|% 1012 (9% 950 | $ 935($% 1401|$ 1400|$ 10.00($ 8.80
3X-Large $ 1150($ 1089|$ 1012|$ 1075($ 935($% 1401|$ 1400|$ 11.00($ 8.80
4X-Large $ 1250($ 1150|$ 1112|$ 1350($ 9.79 | No Bid $ 18.00($ 12.00]|$ 9.95
5X-Large $ 1400($ 1224|$ 1112|$ 14.00($ 9.79 | No Bid $ 18.00($ 13.00]|$ 9.95
7X-Large $ 1700|$ 1224|$ 1312($% 1650(|$ 10.89 | No Bid $ 2200($ 1400|$ 10.95
9X-Large $ 2000(|$ 1224|% 1312($% 1725|$ 10.89 | No Bid $ 2400($ 1500|% 10.95




Bob Barker| Uniforms | Carolina Acme EH Vanity Fair| Thomaston

15. BRAS Co. Mfg. Textiles ICS Supply Company Brands Corp Jindasa

Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
32B $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400|$ 30.00|% 18.00 | NoBid $ 1580 |$ 600.00
34B $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400|$ 30.00|% 18.00 | NoBid $ 1580|$ 600.00
34C $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400|$ 30.00|$% 18.00 | NoBid $ 15.80 | $ 2,400.00
36B $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4118 ($ 15.80| $ 2,400.00
36C $ 1350(|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4942($ 15.80| $ 1,800.00
38B $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4118 ($ 15.80| $ 1,800.00
38C $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4118 ($ 15.80| $ 2,400.00
38D $ 1625|$ 2600|$% 1749($% 3000($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4118 (% 15.80| $ 1,800.00
40C $ 1350(|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 3000|$% 18.00(% 4118 (% 15.80| $ 1,200.00
40DD $ 1745|% 3100|$% 1749($% 3800|$ 36.00|$% 18.00(% 4942($ 15.80| $ 1,350.00
42C $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 4118($ 1580|$% 600.00
42D $ 1625|$% 2600|$% 1749($% 3000($ 36.00|$% 18.00(% 4942($ 15.80| $ 1,350.00
42DDD No Bid $ 26.00|% 17.49 | NoBid $ 3600|$ 4800|% 8986|% 1580 (% 405.00
44C $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400($ 36.00|$% 18.00(% 4243($ 15.80| $ 1,260.00
44D $ 1625|$% 2600|$% 1749($% 3000($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 4942($ 1580|% 675.00
44DD $ 1745|% 3100|$ 1749($% 3800($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 8986($% 1580|% 675.00
44DDD No Bid $ 2600|$% 17.49 | NoBid $ 36.00|$ 48.00 | NoBid $ 1580 |$ 405.00
46D $ 1625|$% 2600|$% 1749($% 3000($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 8986(% 1580|% 675.00
46DD $ 1745|%$ 3200|$% 1749($% 3800($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 8986($% 1580|% 405.00
46DDD No Bid $ 3200|% 17.49 | NoBid $ 36.00|$% 48.00 | NoBid $ 1580 |$ 405.00
48C $ 1350|$ 2100|$ 1749($% 2400|$ 36.00|% 18.00 | NoBid $ 1580 |$ 405.00
48D $ 1625|$% 2600|$% 1749($% 3000($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 8986($% 1580|% 405.00
48DD $ 1745|% 3100|$ 1749($% 3800($ 36.00|% 18.00|% 8986(% 1580|% 405.00




Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina Acme | Vanity Fair| Thomaston
16. BRA, SPORTS Textiles Co. American Mfg. Textiles ICS Supply Brands Corp Jindasa
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
32 $ 2400|$ 2245|% 1954 (% 2300($ 1969|% 26.00($ 30.00 | NoBid $ 19.75($ 420.00
34 $ 2400|$ 2245|$% 1954($% 2300($ 1969|$% 26.00|($% 30.00($ 2933|% 19.75|% 420.00
36 $ 2400|$ 2245|$% 1954($ 2300|$ 1969|$ 26.00($ 3000|$ 2933|$% 19.75($ 1,050.00
38 $ 2400|$ 2245|$% 1954($% 2300|$ 1969|$% 26.00($ 3000|$ 2933|$% 19.75($ 1,050.00
40 $ 2400|$ 2245|$% 1954($% 2300|$ 2079|$ 26.00($ 3600|$ 2933|$ 19.75($ 1,200.00
42 $ 2600|$ 2245|$% 2054($% 2300|$ 2079|$ 3200($% 3600|$ 2933|$ 19.75($ 1,200.00
44 $ 2600|$ 2245|$% 2054($% 2300|$ 2079|$ 3200($% 3600|$ 2933|$ 19.75($ 1,200.00
46 $ 2800|$ 2245|$% 2054 (% 2300|$ 2079|$ 3200($% 3600|$ 2933|$ 19.75($ 1,200.00
48 $ 2800|$ 2245|$% 2154($% 2300($ 2079|$% 3200|$% 36.00($ 2933|% 19.75|$% 540.00
50 $ 2800|$ 2245|% 2154($% 2300($ 20.79|$% 32.00(% 36.00 | NoBid $ 19.75($ 540.00

Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina | Fruit of the Acme Goldwater | Thomaston
17. PANTIES Textiles Co. American Mfg. Textiles Loom ICS Supply Industries Corp Jindasa
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
5 $ 9.00 | $ 6.15| % 724 1% 6.00 | $ 7251 % 9.86 | $ 980 ($ 1000 % 6.60 | $ 6.99 | $ 624.00
6 $ 9.00 | $ 6.15| % 724 1% 6.00 | $ 7251 % 9.86 | $ 980 ($ 1000 % 6.60 | $ 6.99 | $ 936.00
7 $ 9.00 | $ 6.15| % 724 1% 6.00 | $ 7251 % 9.86 | $ 980 ($ 10.00]|% 6.60 | $ 6.99 | $ 624.00
8 $ 9.00 | $ 6.15| % 724 1% 6.00 | $ 7251 % 9.86 | $ 980 (% 1000]|% 6.60 | $ 6.99 | $ 1,980.00
9 $ 9.00 | $ 770 | $ 824 [ $ 6.00 | $ 835 (9% 9.86 | $ 980 (% 10.00]|% 6.60 | $ 8.20 | $ 1,584.00
10 $ 950 | $ 770 | $ 824 [ $ 6.00 | $ 835[$% 1373|% 980 ($ 1000 % 6.60 | $ 820 [$ 792.00
11 $ 950 | $ 770 | $ 824 [ $ 6.00 | $ 835[$% 1373|% 980 ($ 10.00]|% 6.60 | $ 8.20 [ $ 840.00
12 $ 950 | $ 815| % 824 1% 6.00 | $ 835[($% 1373|% 980 (% 1000 % 6.60 | $ 9.30 | $ 252.00
13 $ 950 | $ 815| % 942 |$ 6.00 | $ 945($% 1373|% 980 (% 10.00]|% 6.60 | $ 9.30 | $ 252.00
14 $ 950 | $ 915| % 942 |$ 6.00 | $ 945($% 1373|% 980 (% 1000 ]| % 6.60 | $ 930 | $ 324.00
15 $ 950 | $ 915| % 942 | % 6.00 | $ 9.45 | No Bid $ 980 ($ 10.00]|% 6.60 | $ 9.30 | $ 324.00




Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms | Carolina Acme | Thomaston
18. THERMAL KNIT TOP Textiles Co. Mfg. Textiles Supply Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Large $ 2700|$ 3700|$% 2500(% 3289($% 36.00|% 36.99
X-Large $ 2700|$ 3700|$% 2500(% 3421($ 36.00|% 36.99
2X-Large $ 3100|$ 4700|$% 2500(% 36.85(% 36.00|% 36.99
3X-Large $ 3250|$ 4700|$ 27.00(% 4048 (% 36.00|% 36.99
19. THERMAL KNIT Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms | Carolina Acme | Thomaston
BOTTOM Textiles Co. Mfg. Textiles Supply Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Large $ 2700|$ 3700|$% 2500(% 3289($% 36.00|% 36.99
X-Large $ 2700|$ 3700|$ 25.00($ 3421|% 3.00[$ 36.99
2X-Large $ 3100|$ 5100|$ 2500(% 36.85(% 36.00|% 36.99
3X-Large $ 3250|$% 5100|$ 27.00(% 4048($ 36.00|% 36.99

Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina Acme
20. CAP, KNIT Co. American Mfg. Textiles ICS Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid

$ 929 $ 9.78|$ 12.00 | $ 858 [ $ 990 ($ 36.00




Bob Barker| Uniforms | Carolina Apek The Liberty| Thomaston
21. SWEATSHIRT Co. Mfg. Textiles Apparel Store Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Large $ 6300($ 8200|$% 9636|$% 79.20($ 7800|% 9375
X-Large $ 6300($ 8200|$% 9636|$% 79.20($ 7800|% 9375
2X-Large $ 7740|$ 10900|$ 10285|$% 99.24|$ 8300|$% 101.50
3X-Large $ 7740|$ 10900|$ 10285|$% 99.24|$ 8300|$% 101.50
4X-Large $ 10740|$ 109.00 | $ 102.85 | No Bid $ 83.00($ 108.90
Uniforms
22. SWEAT JACKET Mfg.
Price per dozen Price Bid
Large $ 375.00
X-Large $ 375.00
2X-Large $ 420.00
3X-Large $ 430.00
4X-Large $ 460.00




23. HOODED Uniforms | Carolina | The Liberty| Thomaston
SWEATSHIRT Mfg. Textiles Store Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Medium $ 13300 |$ 131.34|$ 14320 |$ 121.90
Large $ 13300 |$ 131.34|$ 14320 |$ 121.90
X-Large $ 13300 |$ 131.34|$ 14320 |$ 121.90
2X-Large $ 150.00 |$ 13953 |$ 15320 |$ 129.30
3X-Large $ 150.00 [$ 13953 |$ 15320 |$ 129.30
4X-Large $ 15000 |$ 14520|$ 15320 |$ 136.90
5X-Large $ 19000 $ 14520|$ 169.20 | $ 136.90
Min. Order none none 30 dozen  [none
Uniforms | Carolina | The Liberty| Thomaston
24. SWEATPANTS Mfg. Textiles Store Corp
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Medium $ 8600($ 7419|$ 7470|$% 93.75
Large $ 8600|$ 7419|$ 7470|$% 93.75
X-Large $ 8600($ 7419|$ 7470|$ 93.75
2X-Large $ 9400|$ 8514|$% 8460|$ 101.50
3X-Large $ 101.00($ 8514|$ 8460|$ 101.50
4X-Large $ 10900 ($ 9064|$ 90.00|$ 108.90
5X-Large $ 12000|$ 9064|$ 94.00|$ 108.90




Chatham

Robinson's | Bob Barker| Uniforms |Team Safety| Knitting
25. COAT Textiles Co. Mfg. Apparel Mills
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Large $ 193.00|$ 19980 |% 180.00|$ 312.00($ 186.00
X-Large $ 193.00|$ 19980 |% 180.00|$ 312.00($ 186.00
2X-Large $ 21000 |$ 22380 |% 190.00|$ 312.00($ 186.00
3X-Large $ 23000|$ 253.80|% 190.00|$ 384.00 (% 186.00
4X-Large $ 24000 |$ 31380 |$% 210.00|$ 384.00$ 198.00

Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina
26. FLIP-FLOPS Co. American Mfg. Textiles ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 724 (% 1044|% 1025|$% 1320($ 9.00
Medium $ 724 (% 1044|% 1025|$% 1320($ 9.00
Large $ 724 (% 1044|% 1025|$% 1320($ 9.00
X-Large $ 724 (% 1044|% 1025|$% 1320($ 9.00

LOW BID

Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina Thomaston
27. SANDALS Textiles Co. American Mfg. Textiles ICS Corp
Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Small $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 | $ 240 | $ 252 |% 250 | $ 2.49
Medium $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 | $ 240 | $ 252 |% 250 | $ 2.49
Large $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 | $ 240 | $ 252 |$ 250 | $ 2.49
X-Large $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 | $ 240 | $ 252 |$ 250 | $ 2.49
2X-Large $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 | $ 240 | $ 252 |$ 250 | $ 2.49
3X-Large $ 187 1% 148 1% 256 [ $ 240 | $ 252 |$ 250 | $ 2.49




American

Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina Textile Goldwater | Thomaston
28. SHOES, DECK Textiles Co. American Mfg. Textiles Systems | Industries Corp
Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
MEN'S
7 $ 287 [ $ 256 | $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
8 $ 287 [ $ 256 [ $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
9 $ 287 [ $ 256 | $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
10 $ 287 [ $ 256 [ $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
11 $ 287 [ $ 256 [ $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
12 $ 287 [ $ 256 [ $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
13 $ 287 [ $ 256 [ $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
15 $ 287 [ $ 256 | $ 3.08 9% 299 [ $ 274 | $ 228 | $ 301 (% 2.70
WOMEN'S
5 $ 287 [ $ 256 | $ 3.08|% 185($ 274 [ $ 228 | $ 3011% 2.70
6 2.87 2.56 3.08 1.85 2.74 2.28 3.01 2.70
7 2.87 2.56 3.08 1.85 2.74 2.28 3.01 2.70




Robinson's ATD Goldwater
29. SHOE, WORK Textiles | American | Industries
Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
7 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$ 12.60
7-1/2 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
8 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
8-1/2 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
9 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
9-1/2 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
10 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
10-1/2 $ 1500(|$ 1648|% 12.60
11 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
11-1/2 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$% 12.60
12 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$ 12.60
13 $ 1500(|$ 1648|$ 12.60




Bob Barker| Goldwater
30. BOOT, WORK Co. Industries
Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid
7 $ 1392|%$ 1410
7-1/2 $ 1392|%$ 1410
8 $ 1392|%$ 1410
8-1/2 $ 1392|%$ 1410
9 $ 1392|%$ 1410
9-1/2 $ 1392|%$ 1410
10 $ 1392|%$ 1410
10-1/2 $ 1392|%$ 1410
11 $ 1392|%$ 1410
12 $ 1392|%$ 1410
13 $ 1392|%$ 1410
15 $ 1392|%$ 1410




31. ATHLETIC JOGGING | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | Carolina | Goldwater

SHOES Co. American Mfg. Textiles Industries

Price per Pair Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid

5 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

6 $ 11409 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

7 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

8 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 979 | $ 8.60

9 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

10 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

11 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

12 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

13 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

14 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60

15 $ 1140($ 9.68 | $ 6.24 | $ 9.79 | $ 8.60
Uniforms

32. BATHROBES Mfg.

Price per dozen Price Bid

Small $ 100.00

Medium $ 100.00

Large $ 100.00

X-Large $ 100.00

2X-Large $ 100.00

3X-Large $ 110.00

4X-Large $ 120.00




American

33. Bob Barker| American Tabb Textile Acme
BEDSPREAD/BLANKET Co. Tex-chem Textile Systems Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 8712|$ 9907|$ 8160[($% 78.00($ 120.00
Bob Barker| Walter
34. MATTRESS Co. Stephens ICS
Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 40740 |$ 476.40|$ 46.00
American
Bob Barker ATD American Tabb Textile Acme
35. PILLOWCASE Co. American | Tex-chem | Unitex Int'l|  Textile Systems ICS Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 825|% 8.88|% 749 |$ 9.00 | $ 6.65| $ 725($% 1040 | $ 7.00
American
Bob Barker ATD American Textile
36. PILLOW Co. American | CAL PIA | Tex-chem | Systems ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 7200|$ 4896|$% 5700|$% 5240($ 4500|% 67.20

$3.75X12




American

Bob Barker ATD American Tabb Textile Acme
37. SHEETS Co. American | Tex-chem Textile Systems ICS Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Domestic $ 36.48 $ 1990|$% 2350 $ 30.00
Import $ 2665|% 2698 |$% 2159($ 1720($ 2250|$% 2460|%$ 22.00

American

Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | American Tabb Textile Acme
38. TOWEL Co. American Mfg. Tex-chem | Unitex Int'l|  Textile Systems ICS Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Domestic $ 19.98 $ 11.20 $ 1125($% 9.99 $ 1350
Import $ 1350 (% 898 % 10409 709 | $ 9.00 | $ 7.08 | $ 708[$ 1076 | % 8.50

Uniforms
39. BASEBALL CAPS Mfg.
Price per dozen Price Bid
Price per dozen $ 26.00
Min. Order

American

Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | American Tabb Textile Acme
40. WASHCLOTHS Co. American Mfg. Tex-chem | Unitex Int'l|  Textile Systems ICS Supply
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
Domestic $ 1.99 $ 280 [ $ 1.75 $ 5.00
Import $ 2351 % 168 |$ 210 | $ 110 $ 165|% 160 | $ 1351 % 240 | $ 1.75




Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD Uniforms | American
41. LAUNDRY BAGS Textiles Co. American Mfg. Tex-chem ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 4000($ 2995|$% 3048|$% 26.00($ 31.20|$% 42.00
Robinson's | Bob Barker ATD American
42. LAUNDRY BAGS Textiles Co. American | Tex-chem ICS
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 2500(|$ 1575|% 1428|$ 2280($ 24.00
43. CLIPS, LAUNDRY Bob Barker| American
BAG Co. Tex-chem
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 5951|% 1.20
50/Pkg
Bob Barker| Uniforms | American
44. TIE STRINGS, BAG Co. Mfg. Tex-chem
Price per dozen Price Bid | Price Bid | Price Bid
$ 1395(% 250 | $ 2.40
100/Pkg

NOTE: Bid from Charm-Tex was received on Friday, June 12th at 10:43 am. Per the RFP,

late bids cannot be accepted.

Items with no award will be removed from future bids. They are no longer in use by user agencies.




