
Lowest Bidder 2nd  lowest 3rd lowest
Incumbent Incumbent

Flag 
Description

Quality Flags 
Pricing

Waving @ 
You.com

Armstrong 
Flag

Main Street 
Banner 

"The Flag 
Factory"

ConServ 
Flag Co.

Yuletide 
Light 

Display

U.S. 
Flags & 

Poles Inc.
Pageantr
y World

Supply of 
America

Pacific 
Coast 
Flag

Southwest 
School & 

Office

Southwest5
% Local 

Preference
Hamilton 
Uniforms

Hamilton's
Escalation 

of 3 % 
Flaghouse 

Inc.

3x5,CA,nylon 
screened, 

qty.25  $         19.00 17.40$     15.12$        22.50$        15.95$    30.00$    15.00$    14.47$    17.22$    17.50$    17.96$      17.06$        11.90$        $       12.26 no bid 
4x6,CA,nylon 

screened, 
qty.40  $         39.00 30.75$     28.65$        33.00$        26.95$    50.00$    25.00$    27.85$    39.88$    32.00$    28.70$      27.26$        22.90$        $       23.59 no bid 

5x8,CA,nylon 
screened, 

qty.10  $         59.00 42.20$     44.24$        54.00$        43.95$    70.00$    41.00$    48.39$    61.00$    48.00$    43.60$      41.42$        39.79$        $       40.99 no bid 
3x5,US,nylon,5

0 star, 
embroidered  $         16.00 14.90$     13.00$        17.00$        11.95$    27.00$    12.00$    12.63$    14.80$    16.00$    14.90$      14.15$        10.80$        $       11.13 27.68$       

4x6,US,nylon,5
0 star, 

embroidered  $         26.00 19.95$     19.59$        33.00$        17.95$    30.00$    18.00$    20.41$    24.00$    19.80$    19.59$      18.61$        16.78$        $       17.29 39.32$       
5x8,US,nylon,5

0 star, 
embroidered  $         46.00 29.80$     29.24$        50.00$        26.95$    40.00$    29.00$    31.40$    37.50$    32.00$    29.90$      28.40$        25.82$        $       26.60 58.91$       

4x6,San 
Bernardino 

County,nylon 
screened  $         43.00 no bid 45.29$        139.00$      49.95$    100.00$  41.00$    42.16$    15.99$    58.00$    no bid 34.67$        $       35.71 no bid 
4x6,San 

Bernardino 
County,nylon 
embroidered  $       282.00 no bid no bid 257.00$      no bid no bid no bid 459.08$  no bid 180.00$  no bid no bid no bid 

3x5,SanBernar
dino County, 
indoor with 

fringe & pole 
pocket, nylon 

screened  $         42.00 no bid 56.93$        119.00$      44.95$    135.00$  70.00$    83.85$    71.00$    55.00$    no bid 68.95$       no bid 
3x5,SanBernar
dino County, 
indoor with 

fringe & pole 
pocket, nylon 
embroidered  $       254.00 no bid no bid 234.00$      no bid no bid no bid 477.38$  not bid 180.00$  no bid no bid no bid 

Location  Gurnee, IL 
Red Bluff, 
CA

Winchester, 
Ma

Carpenteria,
CA

Sidney, 
NE

Wabash, 
IN

Grason, 
MD

Kyle,     
TX

Jacksonville, 
FL

Sacramento, 
CA

Ontario,    
Ca

Crosswicks, 
NJ

Hasbrouck, 
NJ

FOB
5% local 

preference.
10.0 :  price 
escalations

possible 3-
5% 3% per year

Delivery  15 days aro 
15 days 

aro 10 days aro as needed
7-10 days 

aro
10 days 

aro
5-10 days 

aro

us&ca 
7days, 

county 3-
4wks.

45 days 
aro

10 days 
aro

3-5 days 
aro 15 days aro

3-5 days 
aro

References  NO yes yes yes yes
NO, New 
Business yes yes NO yes yes yes yes

procurement 
cards  yes no yes yes yes no no no no yes yes no no


